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NOTICE OF SALE IN 
EXECUTION OF 

IMMOVABLE PROPERTY 

(AUCTION)               

IN THE HIGH COURT OF 
SOUTH AFRICA 

GAUTENG LOCAL 
DIVISION, 

JOHANNESBURG  

CASE NO.   2022/3713
In the matter between: 
NEDBANK LIMITED  

Execution Creditor
and 
MOILOA, PAUL DISEMA 

(ID No: 711127 5296 083)
1st Judgment Debtor

MOILOA, MAGOGODI IVAN 
(ID No: 770729 0446 080) 
           2nd Judgment Debtor 
In execution of a judgment of 
the High Court of South 
Africa, Gauteng Local Divi-
sion, Johannesburg, in the
abovementioned suit, a Sale 
with a reserve price of R427 
000.00  will be held by
the Sheriff Vereeniging at 91 
General Hertzog Street,
Three Rivers, Vereeniging on 
the 4TH day of MAY 2023 at 
10h00 of the undermentioned 
property of the Judgment
Debtor on the conditions to 
be read out by the Auc-
tioneer at the time of the 
sale, which conditions will lie 
for inspection, prior to the 
sale, at the offices of the 
Sheriff Vereeniging, 91
General Hertzog Street,
Three Rivers, Vereeniging 
(short description of property,
situation and street number) 
Certain: Erf 184  
Peacehaven Township, 
Registration Division I.Q., 
The Province of Gauteng, 
Held under Deed of Transfer 
No. T95030/2005 
Measuring:  
1001 (One Thousand and 
One) square metres 
Situated at:   
35 Jansen Avenue, 
Peacehaven, Vereeniging  
Improvements:  (none of 
which are guaranteed)  
consisting of the following: 
Main building:  
A house consisting of 3 
Bedrooms, Bathroom, Toilet, 
Kitchen, Lounge, Dining 
room  
Outbuilding: Garage  
Constructed: 
Brick under iron roof 
Terms : 10% (Ten percent) of 
the purchase price in cash on 
the day of the sale; the 
balance payable against
registration of transfer to be 
secured by a bank or other 
acceptable guarantee to be 
furnished within 21 (twenty 
one) days from the date of
sale. 
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ble on the day of sale, to be 
calculated as follows: 6% 
(Six percent) on the first 
R100 000.00; 3.5% on R100 
001.00 to R400 000.00 and 
1.5% on the balance of the 
proceeds of the sale, subject 
to a maximum commission of
R40 000.00 plus VAT if 
applicable and a minimum of 
R3000.00 plus VAT if appli-
cable.  
TAKE FURTHER NOTICE 
THAT � 
1.The sale in execution is 
conducted in accordance to 
the Consumer Protection Act 
68 of 2008 as amended, in 
pursuance of an order grant-
ed against the Judgment
Debtor for money owing to 
the Execution Creditor. 
2.The rules of this auction 
and conditions of sale may 
�	
 ����	��	�
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office, 91 General Hertzog 
Street, Three Rivers, Veree-
niging, 24 hours prior to the 
auction. 
3.Registration as a buyer is a 
pre-requisite subject to
conditions, inter alia: 
A) Directive of the Consumer 
Protection Act 68 of 2008.  
(URL http://www.info.gov.za/ 
view/DownloadFileAction?id=
99961). 
B) FICA � legislation i.r.o.
proof of identity and address 
particulars. All bidders are 
required to present their 
Identity Document with proof 
of residence for FICA com-
pliance. 
C) The Purchaser shall pay 
to the Sheriff a deposit of 
10% of the purchase price in 
cash or by bank guaranteed 
cheque on the day of the 
sale. The balance shall be 
paid against transfer and 
shall be secured by a guar-
antee issued by a financial 
institution approved by the 
execution creditor or his or 
her attorney and shall be 
furnished to the Sheriff within 
twenty one (21) days after 
the sale.     
D) The property may be 
taken possession of after 
signature of the conditions of 
sale, payment of the deposit 
and upon balance of the 
purchase price being se-
cured in terms of condition 
7.1 of the conditions of sale. 
E) Should the Purchaser 
receive possession of the
property, the Purchaser shall 
be liable for occupational 
rental at the rate of 1% of the 
purchase price per month 
from the date of possession 
of the property to date of 
registration. The auction will 
be conducted by the Sheriff,
Mr MJ Manyandi or his
deputy.  
Advertising costs at current 
publication rates and sale 
costs according to court 
rules, apply. 
Dated at Johannesburg on 
this the 27th day of February 
2023. 
(sgd. N Roets)  
ROSSOUWS LESIE INC. 
8 Sherborne Road 
Parktown 
Johannesburg 
PO Box 1588, Johannesburg 
Tel: (011) 726-9000 
Fax: (011) 726-3855 
Ref: M0027237/N Roets/ 
R Beetge 
Email: 
rikkib@rossouws.co.za 
(Account No. 
8150525798801) 

02SB3O

NOTICE OF SALE IN 
EXECUTION OF 

IMMOVABLE PROPERTY 

(AUCTION) 

IN THE HIGH COURT OF 
SOUTH AFRICA 

GAUTENG LOCAL 
DIVISION, 

JOHANNESBURG         
CASE NO.  2022/3716 

In the matter between: 
NEDBANK LIMITED  
(formerly Nedcor Bank  
Limited)   

Execution Creditor
and 
LEOPENG, KHOKHE  
AUBREY   

1st Judgment Debtor
(ID No: 601125 5594 088) 
LEOPENG, MOKGAETJI 
SUSAN   

2nd Judgment Debtor
(ID No: 630318 0421 085) 
In execution of a judgment of 
the High Court of South 
Africa, Gauteng Local Divi-
sion, Johannesburg, in the 
abovementioned suit, a Sale 
with a reserve price of  
R200 000.00, will be held by 
the Sheriff Johannesburg 
South at Shop No. 2 Vista 
Centre, 22 Hillary Road, Cnr. 
Trevor Street, Gillview,
Johannesburg on the 25th
day of April 2023 at 10h00
of the undermentioned prop-
erty of the Judgment Debtor 
on the conditions to be read 
out by the Auctioneer at the 
time of the sale, which condi-
tions will lie for inspection, 
prior to the sale, at the offic-
es of the Sheriff Johannes-
burg South, at Shop No. 2 
Vista Centre, 22 Hillary 
Road, Cnr. Trevor Street, 
Gillview,  
Johannesburg (short descrip-
tion of property, situation and 
street number) 
Certain:  A UNIT CON-
SISTING OF - Section No. 2
as shown and more fully 
described on Sectional Plan
No. SS106/1993 in the
scheme known as Shammar
Court in respect of the land 
and building or buildings 
situate at Rosettenville
Township, Local Authority 
City of Johannesburg of 
which section the floor area, 
according to the said sec-
tional plan, is 70 (seventy)
square metres in extent; and 
An undivided share in the 
common property in the 
scheme apportioned to the 
said section in accordance 
with the participation quota 
as endorsed on the said 
sectional plan, Held by Deed 
of Transfer No. ST4175/2003 
Situated at: No. 2 Shammar
Court, 169 Lang Street, 
Rosettenville, Johannesburg 
Improvements:   
(none of which are guaran-
teed) consisting of the follow-
ing: 
Main building: 
Dining room, 2 Bedrooms, 
Kitchen, Bathroom, W/C  
Outbuilding: None  
Constructed: 
Brick under cement 
Terms : 10% (Ten percent) 
of the purchase price in cash 
on the day of the sale; the 
balance payable against
registration of transfer to be 
secured by a bank or other 
acceptable guarantee to be 
furnished within 21 (twenty 
one) days from the date of 
sale. 
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ble on the day of sale, to be 
calculated as follows: 6% 
(Six percent) on the first 
R100 000.00; 3.5% on  
R100 001.00 to R400 000.00 
and 1.5% on the balance of 
the proceeds of the sale, 
subject to a maximum com-
mission of R40 000.00 plus
VAT if applicable and a 
minimum of R3000.00 plus 
VAT if applicable.  
TAKE FURTHER NOTICE 
THAT � 
1.This sale is a sale in exe-
cution pursuant to a judg-
ment obtained in the above 
Court. 
2.The rules of this auction 
and a full advertisement is 
available 24 hours before the 
auction at the office of the 
Sheriff Johannesburg South, 
Shop 2 Vista Centre, 22 
Hillary Road, cnr. Trevor 
Street, Gillview. 
3.Registration as a buyer is a 
pre-requisite subject to
conditions, inter alia: 
A)Directive of the Consumer 
Protection Act 68 of 2008. 
(URL http://www.info.gov.za/ 
view/DownloadFileAction?id=
99961). 
B)FICA � legislation i.r.o. 
proof of identity and address 
particulars.  
C)Payment of a Registration 
Fee of R50 000.00 in cash or 
EFT that must reflect in the 
Sherif���
�������
�
��
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��	

sale. 
D)Registration Conditions � 
no person will be allowed on 
the premises if they are not 
registered for FICA and CPA. 
The office of the Sheriff for 
Johannesburg South will 
conduct the sale with auc-
tioneers J.A. THOMAS 
and/or P. ORA and/or  
A JEGELS.  
Advertising costs at current 
publication rates and sale 
costs according to court 
rules, apply. 
Dated at Johannesburg on 
this the 8th day of February 
2023. 
(sgd. N Roets)  
ROSSOUWS LESIE INC. 
8 Sherborne Road 
Parktown 
Johannesburg 
PO Box 1588,  
Johannesburg 
Tel: (011) 726-9000 
Fax: (011) 726-3855 
Ref: M0020630/N Roets/ 
R Beetge 
Email: 
rikkib@rossouws.co.za 

02SBCQ

NOTICE OF SALE IN 
EXECUTION OF  

IMMOVABLE PROPERTY 

(AUCTION)               

IN THE HIGH COURT OF 
SOUTH AFRICA 

GAUTENG LOCAL 
DIVISION, 

JOHANNESBURG 

CASE NO.  2022/001086
In the matter between: 
NEDBANK LIMITED 

Execution Creditor
And 
MABELE, CYRIL MXOLISI 
(ID No:750930 5371 083) 

           Judgment Debtor 
In execution of a judgment of 
the High Court of South 
Africa, Gauteng Local Divi-
sion, Johannesburg, in the 
abovementioned suit, a Sale 
with a reserve price of  
R420 000.00 will be held by 
the Sheriff Randburg West
at Unit C1 Mount Royal, 657 
James Crescent, Halfway 
House, Midrand on the 2ND 
day of MAY 2023 at 11h00 of 
the undermentioned property 
of the Judgment Debtor on 
the conditions to be read out 
by the Auctioneer at the time 
of the sale, which conditions
will lie for inspection, prior to 
the sale, at the offices of the 
Sheriff Randburg West, Unit 
C1 Mount Royal, 657 James 
Crescent, Halfway House, 
Midrand (short description of 
property, situation and street 
number) 
Certain: Erf 5200  
Cosmo City Extension 5 
Township, Registration
Division I.Q., The Province of 
Gauteng and also known as 
5200 Alabama Avenue,
Cosmo City Ext. 5, Held by 
Deed of Transfer No.
T49072/2006 (PTA) 
Measuring:    
400 (Four Hundred) square 
metres 
Improvements:  (none of
which are guaranteed) con-
sisting of the following: 
Main building: 
House consisting of 3 Bed-
rooms, 2 Bathrooms, Dining 
room, Lounge, Kitchen  
Outbuilding: None   
Constructed: 
Brick under tiles 
Terms : 10% (Ten percent) of 
the purchase price in cash on 
the day of the sale; the 
balance payable against
registration of transfer to be 
secured by a bank or other 
acceptable guarantee to be 
furnished within 21 (twenty 
one) days from the date of 
sale. 
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ble on the day of sale, to be 
calculated as follows: 6% 
(Six percent) on the first 
R100 000.00; 3.5% on 
R100 001.00 to R400 000.00 
and 1.5% on the balance of 
the proceeds of the sale, 
subject to a maximum com-
mission of R40 000.00 plus 
VAT if applicable and a 
minimum of R3000.00 plus 
VAT if applicable.  
TAKE FURTHER NOTICE 
THAT � 
1.The sale in execution is 
conducted in accordance to 
the Consumer Protection Act 
68 of 2008 as amended, in 
pursuance of an order grant-
ed against the Judgment 
Debtor for money owing to 
the Execution Creditor. 
2.The rules of this auction
and conditions of sale may 
�	
 ����	��	�
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 ��	
 ��	
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office, Unit C1 Mount Royal, 
657 James Crescent, Half-
way House, Midrand, during 
office hours. 
3.Registration as a buyer is a 
pre-requisite subject to
conditions, inter alia: 
A) Directive of the Consumer 
Protection Act 68 of 2008.  
(URL http://www.info.gov.za/ 
view/DownloadFileAction?id=
99961). 
B) FICA � legislation i.r.o. 
proof of identity and address 
particulars. All bidders are 
required to present their 
Identity Document with proof 
of residence for FICA  
compliance. 
C) All bidders are required to 
pay R50 000.00 (refundable) 
registration fee one (1) day 
prior to the date of sale, EFT 
or bank guaranteed cheque, 
NO CASH ACCEPTED, in 
order to obtain a buyers card. 
D) The Purchaser shall pay 
to the Sheriff a deposit of 
10% of the purchase price in 
cash or by bank guaranteed 
cheque on the day of the 
sale. The balance shall be 
paid against transfer and 
shall be secured by a  
guarantee issued by a f 
inancial institution approved 
by the execution creditor or 
his or her attorney and shall 
be furnished to the Sheriff 
within twenty one (21) days 
after the sale.     
E) The property may be 
taken possession of after 
signature of the conditions of 
sale, payment of the deposit 
and upon balance of the 
purchase price being  
secured in terms of condition 
7.1 of the conditions of sale. 
F) Should the Purchaser 
receive possession of the 
property, the Purchaser shall 
be liable for occupational 
rental at the rate of 1% of the 
purchase price per month 
from the date of possession 
of the property to date of 
registration. 
The auction will be conduct-
ed by the Sheriff or his/her 
deputy.  
Advertising costs at current 
publication rates and sale 
costs according to court 
rules, apply. 
Dated at Johannesburg on 
this the 15th day of February
2023. 
(sgd. N Roets)  
ROSSOUWS LESIE INC. 
8 Sherborne Road 
Parktown 
Johannesburg 
PO Box 1588, Johannesburg 
Tel: (011) 726-9000 
Fax: (011) 726-3855 
Ref: M0026413/ N Roets/  
R Beetge 
Email: 
rikkib@rossouws.co.za 
(Account No. 
8966256362301) 

02SB3N

NOTICE 

PROPOSED GRAVE  

EXHUMATION AND  

RELOCATION  
Of 6 Identified Graves And 
Testing For 4 Potential 
Graves Located Within The 
Umgeni Waters Servitude 
For The Proposed Ludeke 
Dam Construction In The 
Winnie Madikizela-Mandela
Local Municipality Of Al-
fred Nzo District Municipal-
ity Eastern Cape Province, 
South Africa 
Project Name: Grave  
Exhumation and Relocation
of 6 Identified Graves and 
testing for 4 graves  
belonging to the Hlangabezo 
family in the Eastern Cape 
Applicant: Ganwa  
Consulting and  
Development on behalf of
Umgeni Water 
Location: The project area is
located at Silangwe Village, 
Winnie Madikizela-Mandela
Local Municipality of Alfred 
Nzo District Municipality in 
the Eastern Cape Province. 
Proposed Activity: 
Notice is hereby given that 
Setjo Sesho Consultant
(Pty) Ltd has been appointed 
by Ganwa Consulting and
Development on behalf of
Umgeni Water, to apply for 
the proposed grave exhuma-
tion and relocation of 6 
identified graves and testing 
for 4 potential graves belong-
ing to the Hlangabezo fami-
ly, located within the Umgeni 
Water servitude for the 
proposed construction of
Ludeke dam in the Eastern 
Cape Province, South Africa 
Legal Requirements: 
The application is made in 
terms of the: 
- Human Tissue Act, No. 65 
of 1983 (as amended); the 
Removal of Graves and
Dead Bodies Ordinance
(Ord), No. 7 of 1925; 
- The Exhumation Ordinance, 
No 12 of 1980; 
- Section 35 and Section 36 
of the National Heritage 
Resources Act (NHRA), No.
25 of 1999; the South African
Heritage Resources Agency 
(SAHRA) for the approval to
exhume the remains of 
individuals affected by the 
above-mentioned develop-
ment and re-interment in the
municipal declared cemetery 
or location as agreed with the 
next of kin. 
Registration And  
Comment: 
To ensure that you are 
identified and registered as
an interested or affected 
party and that your com-
ments are considered,
please submit your name, 
contact details, reason for 
your interest and is-
sues/concerns, in writing or 
telephonically, to Setjo
Sesho Consultants (Pty)
within 60 days of this notice, 
and no later than 7th of June 
2023. Please note that only 
registered Interested and 
Affected Parties (I&APs) will 
be notified of further oppor-
tunities for involvement in 
this process. For any other 
inputs please contact
SAHRA directly and Cc Setjo 
Sesho Consultants team
members. SAHRA contact 
person: Ms. Thingahangwi 
Tshivhase 
(TTshivhase@sahra.org.za) 
Any queries, comments, or 
concerns with regards to this 
application can be directed to 
SETJO SESHO  
CONSULTANTS (PTY) LTD 
AT: 
Contact person: Mrs Jennifer 
Munyai 
Cell: 076 3821 892 
jennifer@setjosesho.co.za 
info@setjosesho.co.za 
Postal address:  
11 Greenfields,  
79 Grimthorpe Avenue,  
Lincoln Meade,  
Pietermaritzburg 
                                02SBRT 

NOTICE OF SALE IN 
EXECUTION 

IN THE HIGH COURT OF 
SOUTH AFRICA 

(GAUTENG DIVISION, 
PRETORIA) 

CASE NO: 13593/2022
In the matter between: 
NEDBANK LIMITED 

Plaintiff
And 
ASSARIA KGALIMI  
MATABOGE  

                 1st Defendant 
SALAMINA KGALIMI  
MATABOGE  
                      2nd Defendant 
In Execution of a Judgment 
granted on 08TH AUGUST 
2022 of the High Court of 
South Africa, (Gauteng
Division, Pretoria) in the 
abovementioned matter, a 
sale in execution will be held 
at the offices of the SHERIFF
PRETORIA SOUTH WEST
at AZANIA BUILDING, CNR 
ISCOR AVENUE AND IRON 
TERRACE, WEST PARK on
THURSDAY, the 4TH   day
of MAY 2023 at 10H00 of the
���������	
� ����
����������

property WITHOUT  
RESERVE. and on the
conditions to be read out by 
the Auctioneer namely the 
Sheriff, PRETORIA SOUTH 
WEST prior to the sale and 
which conditions can be 
inspected at the offices of the 
Sheriff PRETORIA SOUTH 
WEST at  AZANIA  
BUILDING, CNR ISCOR 
AVENUE AND IRON  
TERRANCE, WEST PARK,
prior to the sale: 
PORTION 4 OF ERF 24 
ROSEVILLE TOWNSHIP 
Registration Division: J.R. 
Province of Gauteng 
MEASURING: 1092 (one
thousand and ninety two) 
square metres 
Held by deed of transfer no. 
T28740/2017 
The property is situated at 
HOUSE NO 663 SMOOK 
AVENUE, ROSEVILLE, 
PRETORIA and consists of
Improvements (which are not 
warranted to be correct and 
are not guaranteed): 
3x Bedroom, 2x Bathroom, 
1x Kitchen, 2x Living Room, 
3x Garage,  
1x Laundry, 1x Carport 
Zoning:  Residential  
CONDITIONS: 
10% (Ten Percent) of the 
purchase price on the day of
sale and the balance payable 
against registration of Trans-
fer to be secured by a Bank 
guarantee or any other 
acceptable guarantee to be 
furnished to the Sheriff within 
21 (Twenty-One) days from
the date of the sale. 
Dated at Pretoria on this 08th

day of February 2023  
Riette Van Der Merwe 
Attorneys for Plaintiff 
WEAVIND & WEAVIND INC 
Block E 
Glenfield Office Park 
361 Oberon Street 
Faerie Glen 
Pretoria 
TEL: (012) 346 3098 
RIETTE VAN DER  
MERWE /ar/RB0085 

02SCAW

NOTICE OF SALE IN 
EXECUTION 

IN THE HIGH COURT OF 
SOUTH AFRICA 

(GAUTENG DIVISION, 
PRETORIA) 

CASE NO: 60497/2021
In the matter between: 
NEDBANK LIMITED  

Plaintiff
And 
JOHN MASINGITA 
MOTSUMI  

                 1st Defendant 
SHONGILE PORTIA 
MATHEBULA  
                      2nd Defendant 
In Execution of a Judgment 
granted on 09 SEPTEMBER
2022 of the High Court of 
South Africa, (Gauteng
Division, Pretoria) in the 
abovementioned matter, a 
sale in execution will be held 
at the offices of the SHERIFF 
PRETORIA SOUTH WEST 
at AZANIA BUILDING, 
CORNER OF ISCOR  
AVENUE AND IRON  
TERRACE, WEST PARK on  
THURSDAY, the 4TH day of
MAY 2023 at 10H00 of the
���������	
� ����
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property subject to:  
A RESERVE PRICE OF 
R420 000.00 and on the
conditions to be read out by 
the Auctioneer namely the 
Sheriff, PRETORIA SOUTH 
WEST and which conditions
can be inspected at the 
offices of the Sheriff  
PRETORIA SOUTH WEST 
at AZANIA BUILDING, 
CORNER OF ISCOR  
AVENUE AND IRON  
TERRACE, WEST PARK, 
Prior to the sale: 
PORTION 1 OF ERF 5331 
LOTUS GARDENS  
EXTENSION 2 TOWNSHIP 
Registration Division: J.R.
PROVINCE OF GAUTENG 
Measuring:  
267 (Two Hundred And 
Sixty-Seven)  
Square Metres 
Held by deed of transfer No. 
T19049/2010 
The property is situated at 
NO 9 CERIUM STREET, 
LOTUS GARDENS,  
PRETORIA and consists of
Improvements (which are not 
warranted to be correct and 
are not guaranteed): 
2x bedroom, 1x bathroom, 1x 
kitchen, 1x living room 
Zoning:  Residential  
CONDITIONS: 
10% (TEN PERCENT) of the 
purchase price on the day of
sale and the balance payable 
against registration of Trans-
fer to be secured by a Bank 
guarantee or any other 
acceptable guarantee to be 
furnished to the Sheriff within 
21 (TWENTY-ONE) days 
from the date of the sale. 
Dated at Pretoria on this 13th
day of February 2023 
Riette Van Der Merwe 
Attorneys for Plaintiff 
WEAVIND & WEAVIND INC 
Block E 
Glenfield Office Park 
361 Oberon Street 
Faerie Glen 
Pretoria 
Tel: (012) 346 3098 
RIETTE VAN DER  
MERWE /ar/N88848 

02SC9K

NOTICE OF SALE IN 
EXECUTION 

IN THE HIGH COURT OF 
SOUTH AFRICA  

(GAUTENG DIVISION, 
PRETORIA) 

CASE NO: 15340/2022
In the matter between: 
NEDBANK LIMITED  
                                  Plaintiff 
and 
PATRICK KIYEMBA  
                             Defendant 
In Execution of a Judgment 
granted on 25th of July 2022
of the High Court of South 
Africa, (Gauteng Division, 
Pretoria) in the abovemen-
tioned matter, a sale in 
execution will be held at the 
offices of the Sheriff  
Pretoria South West At 
Azania Building, Cnr Iscor
Avenue And Iron Terrace, 
West Park On Thursday, 
The 4th Day Of May 2023 
At 10h00 ��� ��������	
�	��

undermentioned property
subject to: A Reserve Price
Of R850 000.00 and on the
conditions to be read out by 
the Auctioneer namely the 
Sheriff, Pretoria South West
and which conditions can be 
inspected at the offices of the 
Sheriff Pretoria South West 
At Azania Building, Cnr Iscor 
Avenue And Iron Terrace, 
West Park, prior to the sale: 
Portion 8 of ERF 541 West
Park Township 
Registration Division: J.R.
Province Of Gauteng 
Measuring: 780 (seven
hundred and eighty) square 
metres 
Held By Deed Of Transfer 
No. T67458/2020 
The property is situated at 
No 2 Channel Road, West 
Park, Pretoria and consists
of Improvements (which are 
not warranted to be correct
and are not guaranteed): 
3x Bedroom, 1x Bathroom, 
2x Carport, 1x Kitchen, 2x 
Living Room, 
1x Garage, 1x Other 
Zoning: Residential 
Conditions: 
10% (ten percent) of the 
purchase price on the day of 
sale and the balance payable 
against registration of Trans-
fer to be secured by a Bank 
guarantee or any other 
acceptable guarantee to be 
furnished to the Sheriff within 
21 (twenty-one) days from
the date of the sale. 
Dated at Pretoria on This
13th day of Febryary 2023 
Riette Van Der Merwe 
Attorneys For Plaintiff 
WEAVIND & WEAVIND INC 
Block E, Glenfield Office
Park, 361 Oberon Street, 
Faerie Glen, Pretoria 
Tel: 012 346 3098 
RIETTE VAN DER  
MERWE /ar/RB0084 
                               02SCBR 

NOTICE 
Insolvent Estate: BESTER,
MARNO MICHAEL  
ID NO: 900313 5029 08 5  
��������	
���	T001303/2021  
In terms of Section 81 of the 
Insolvency Act no 24 of 
1936, notice is hereby given 
that the under mentioned has 
been appointed as Trustee/s 
of the abovementioned
insolvent estate and that all 
debtors of the estate are 
hereby compelled to pay 
their debts to the Trustee.
The Second Meeting of 
Creditors of the above 
mentioned estate will be 
held on Monday, 8 May 
2023 at 10h00 before the
Presiding Officer, Master of 
the High Court, Pretoria for 
the following:-  
1. Proof of claims;  

�	����������	��	����������	

report; and  
3. Adoption of Resolutions.  
C Murray, Z Cassim &  
Mc Sutherland Co-Trustees  
C/O SECHABA TRUST  
PO Box 11889,  
The Tramshed, 0126  
Tel: 012 340 0093 
                                02SCJL 

NOTICE 
Insolvent Estate: BESTER,  
MARNO MICHAEL  
ID No: 900313 5029 08 5  
��������	
���	T001303/2021  
In terms of Section 81 of the 
Insolvency Act no 24 of 
1936, notice is hereby given 
that the under mentioned has 
been appointed as Trustee/s 
of the abovementioned
insolvent estate and that all 
debtors of the estate are 
hereby compelled to pay 
their debts to the Trustee.
The Second Meeting of 
Creditors of the above 
mentioned estate will be 
held on Monday, 8 May 
2023 at 10h00 before the
Presiding Officer, Master of 
the High Court, Pretoria for
the following:-  
1. Proof of claims;  

�	����������	��	����������	

report; and  
3. Adoption of Resolutions.  
C Murray, Z Cassim &  
Mc Sutherland Co-Trustees  
C/O SECHABA TRUST  
PO Box 11889,  
The Tramshed, 0126  
Tel: 012 340 0093 
                                 02SCIH 

NOTICE 
In Likwidasie: PINT SIZE 
TRADING (PTY) LTD 
Registrasie Nommer: 
2017/082702/07 
Meestersverwysing: 
D000228/2022 
Neem hiermee kennis dat 
PETRUS JACOBUS CORNé 
VAN STADEN aangestel is
as Likwidateur van boge-
melde boedel, en dat per-
sone wat enigiets aan die
boedel verskuldig is, die 
skulde onmiddellik by geno-
emde Likwidateur moet
betaal. 
Die Algemene (tweede)
vergadering van skuldeisers, 
lede of kontribuante van 
genoemde boedel sal gehou 
word voor die Voorsittende 
Beampte, die MEESTER
VAN DIE KWA-ZULU  
NATAL  
HOOGGEREGSHOF -
DURBAN op 10 MEI 2023
om 10:00 vir die volgende
doeleindes: 
(1)Voorlegging van die 
Likwidateur se verslag; 
(2)Aanvaarding van die 
besluite; 
(3)Verdere bewys van eis/e; 
ST.ADENS  
INTERNATIONAL 
Posbus 1314, Groenkloof, 
0027 
Tel.: (012) 344-4315 
Verw: M VAN DEVENTER 

02SBLT

NOTICE 

1ST FREIGHT AND 
LOGISTICS BK (IN 

LIKWIDASIE) 
Registrasie Nommer(s): 
2006/109562/23 
Meestersverwysing: 
N000125/2022 
Neem hiermee kennis dat  
M HAYWOOD & L SIBIYA
aangestel is as likwidateurs 
van bogemelde Beslote
Korporasie, en dat persone 
wat enigiets aan die boedel 
verskuldig is, die skulde 
onmiddellik by genoemde 
kurators moet betaal. 
��� ����	�� ��� 
���
����
byeenkoms van skuldeisers 
en lede van genoemde 
boedel sal gehou word voor 
die Voorsittende Beampte, 
die MEESTER VAN DIE 
HOOGGEREGSHOF,  
PIETERMARITZBURG op
12 MEI 2023 om 10H00 vir
die volgende doeleindes:  
(1) Aanvaarding van die 
likwidateurs se verslag;  
(2) Aanvaarding van die 
besluite;  
(3) Verdere bewys van eis/e. 
ST.ADENS  
INTERNATIONAL 
Posbus 1314, Groenkloof, 
0027 
Tel.: (012) 344-4315 
Verw.: M van Deventer 

02SBLU

NOTICE 
Insolvent Estate: FOURIE,  
MAGDALENE ELIZABETH 
��������	
��: T4423/12 
Notice is hereby given that 
the Second and Final Liqui-
dation, Distribution and
Contribution Account in the 
above matter will be open for 
inspection at the Office of the 
Pretoria for a period of 14
(fourteen) days from 14 April 
2023. 
C Murray 
Trustees 
C/O SECHABA TRUST 
P O Box 11889 
Tramshed 
0126 
Tel: 012 340 0093 
                                   02SCII

NOTICE TO CREDITORS IN 
DECEASED ESTATES 

All persons having claims 
against the undermentioned 
estate must lodge it with the 
Executor concerned within 
30 days (or as indicated) 
from date of publication 
hereof.  
Province: Western Cape  
Estate No: 1534/2023 
Surname: JOUBERT 
First Names:  
DAVID GERHARDUS  
LOMBARD 
Date of Birth: 1940-08-23 
ID No: 400823 5030 08 6 
Last Address:  
26 Elbertha Avenue, Die 
Boord, Stellenbosch, 7600 
Date of Death: 2022-12-02 
��������	
���
��	����	���� 
Executor or Authorised
Agent: Dirk Daniel Joubert
and Maria Magdalena Smith 
Cluver Markotter Building, 
Mill Street, Stellenbosch, 
7600 
Period allowed for Lodge-
ment of claims: 30 
CLUVER MARKOTTER INC 
PO Box 12, Stellenbosch,  
7599 
sisteeng@ 
cluvermarkotter.law 
Tel: 021 808 5600 

02SAY7

CAPE BRUSH AND 
HARDWARE SA (PTY) LTD 

(IN LIQUIDATION) 
Registration Number: 
2018/414333/07 
Masters Reference: 
C000915/2022 
Notice is hereby given that  
R STEYNSBURG & SAG 
KHAMMISSA was appointed
as joint Liquidators of
abovementioned Company, 
and that the persons indebt-
ed to the Company are 
required to pay their debts to 
them forthwith unless other-
wise indicated. 
A general (second) meeting 
of creditors and members or 
contributories will be held
before the Presiding Officer, 
the Magistrate, Kuilsrivier
on 3 May 2023 at 09H00 for
the following purposes:  
(1) Submission of the 
��������	
��

�	
��� 
(2) Adoption of the  
resolutions;  
(3)Further proof of claim/s 
ST.ADENS  
INTERNATIONAL 
P.O. Box 1314, Groenkloof, 
0027 
Tel.: (012) 344 4315 
Ref.: C Bezuidenhout 

02SBLW

INSOLVENTE BOEDEL 
KESHLIN PILLAY 

ID No: 710807 5085 08 6 
Meestersverwysing: 
D73/2022 
Neem hiermee kennis dat 
PJC VAN STADEN & 
P CAROLUS aangestel is as
kurator van bogemelde
boedel, en dat persone wat 
enigiets aan die boedel 
verskuldig is, die skulde 
onmiddellik by genoemde 
kurators moet betaal. 
��� ������� 	
�����
�� ����
skuldeisers van genoemde 
boedel sal gehou word voor 
die Voorsittende Beampte, 
die MEESTER VAN DIE 
HOOGGEREGSHOF,  
DURBAN op 3 MEI 2023 om
10H00 vir die volgende
doeleindes :  
(1) Aanvaarding van die 
kurators se verslag;  
(2) Aanvaarding van die 
besluite;  
(3) Verdere bewys van eis/e. 
ST.ADENS  
INTERNATIONAL 
Posbus 1314, Groenkloof, 
0027 
Tel.: (012) 344-4315 
Verw.: C Bezuidenhout 

02SBLV

NOTICE TO CREDITORS IN 
DECEASED ESTATES 

All persons having claims 
against the undermentioned 
estate must lodge it with the 
Executor concerned within 
30 days (or as indicated) 
from date of publication 
hereof. 
Province: Gauteng                 
Estate No: 003446/2023 
Surname: VENTER 
First Name: LOUIS 
Date of Birth: 1942-09-20 
ID No: 4209205008082 
Last Address: Unit 35, 122 
Sunrise View Retirement 
Village, Gauteng 
Date of Death: 2022-12-26 
��������	
���
��	 
Johannesburg 
Surviving Spouse: ANNA 
FRANCINA VENTER 
Date of Birth: 1944-02-10 
ID No: 4402100046089 
Executor or authorised  
agent: Lauren Rose Hean 
APPLETON FIDUCIARY  
SERVICES 
Suite 82, Private Bag X3, 
Plumstead, 7801 
lauren.hean@appleton.com  
Tel: 0800 506 070  

02SALZ

NOTICE TO CREDITORS IN 
DECEASED ESTATES 

All persons having claims 
against the undermentioned 
estate must lodge it with the 
Executor concerned within  
30 days (or as indicated) 
from date of publication  
hereof.  
Province: Gauteng   
Estate No: 001462/2023 
Surname: PILLAY 
First Names: GOPAUL 
Date of Birth: 1955-11-21 
ID No: 5511215145088 
Last Address: 14 Katdoring 
Avenue, Palmridge 
Date of Death: 2018-04-01 
��������	
���
��	 
Johannesburg  
Surviving Spouse:  
THANJAMMAH PILLAY 
Date of birth: 1955-06-04 
ID No: 5506040118086 
Executor or Authorised
Agent: AN Attorneys 
Period allowed for lodgement 
of claims: 30 Days 
ANGELIQUE NAICKER  
ATTORNEYS 
91 Harry Street, Robertsham, 
Johannesburg. 
info@an-attorneys.co.za 
Tel: 011 680 4014 

02SAM2

NOTICE TO CREDITORS IN 
DECEASED ESTATES 

All persons having claims 
against the under-mentioned
estate must lodge it with the 
Executor concerned within 
30 days (or as indicated) 
from date of publication 
hereof. 
Province: KwaZulu-Natal 
Estate No: 003471/2023 
Surname: NEL 
First Names:  
NICOLAAS JOHANNES 
Date of Birth: 1978-08-17 
ID No: 780817 5164 08 5 
Last Address: NO.6 Ethelle 
Court, 115 Prospect Road, 
Umbilo, 4001 
Date of Death: 2023-01-30 
��������	
���
��	������ 
CAPITAL LEGACY  
BOARD OF EXECUTORS 
AND TRUST COMPANY 
(PTY) LTD 
Block A, 2 Ncondo Place, 
Umhlanga Ridge, Durban, 
4319 
tracey@ 
capitallegacy.co.za 
Tel: 021 036 4040 

02SB1M

NOTICE TO CREDITORS IN 
DECEASED ESTATES 

All persons having claims 
against the undermentioned 
estate must lodge it with the 
Executor concerned within 
30 days (or as indicated) 
from date of publication 
hereof.  
Province: KwaZulu-Natal  
Estate No: 003681/2023 
Surname: JONES                 
First Names: SEAN DAVID 
Date of Birth: 1970-08-20 
ID No: 7008205100080 
Last Address: 75 Tipuana 
Drive, Glen Anil, Durban 
North, 4051 
Date of Death: 2022-10-27 
Masters Office: Durban 
CAPITAL LEGACY  
BOARD OF EXECUTORS
AMD TRUST COMPANY 
(PTY) LTD 
Block A, 2 Ncondo Place, 
Umhlanga Ridge, Durban, 
4319 
tracey@capitallegacy.co.za 
Tel: 021 036 0404 

                                02SBAA 

REMAINDER ERF 1 
COMMERCIA EXT 1 (PTY) 

LTD (IN VOLUNTARY 
LIQUIDATION) 

(REG. NO: 2021 / 
135281/07) 

Notice is hereby given in 
terms of Section 356(2)(b) of 
the Companies Act, No. 61 of 
1973, as amended, that a 
Special Resolution for the 
winding up of the above-
named company as a Credi-
tors Voluntary Winding Up 
was duly passed by the 
Directors on 7 March 2023,
and registered with the 
Companies and Intellectual 
Property Commission on 22
March 2023. 
Attorney firm name and
address 
RUBEN LANCE HEALLEY 
INC  
43 Parker Street,  
Durbanville, 7550 
Tel: 084 701 5241  
Email: info@rlhlaw.co.za 

NOTICE TO CREDITORS IN 
DECEASED ESTATES 

All persons having claims 
against the undermentioned 
estate must lodge it with the 
Executor concerned within 
30 days (or as indicated) 
from date of publication 
hereof.  
Province: Western Cape  
Estate No: 007826/2020 
Surname: CHRISTIAN  
First Names: MARIA 
Date of Birth: 1931-05-02 
ID No: 3105020094086 
Last Address: Greystraat
174, Worcester 
Date of Death: 2020-04-07 
��������	
���
��	Kaapstad 
Period allowed for lodgement 
of claims: 30 
WILNA ROUX  
ATTORNEYS  
INCORPORATED 
Baringstraat 27, 
Worcester 6850 
wilna@wilnaroux.co.za 
Tel: 023 342 2098 

02SAI2

NOTICE TO CREDITORS IN 
DECEASED ESTATES 

All persons having claims 
against the undermentioned 
estate must lodge it with the 
Executor concerned within 
30 days (or as indicated) 
from date of publication 
hereof.  
Province: Western Cape  
Estate No: 26594/2022 
Surname: FRANCKS  
First Names: STEWART  
DOUGLAS 
Date of Birth: 1947-02-05 
ID No: 4702055138181 
Last Address: 31 Links Drive, 
Pinelands, 7405 
Date of Death: 2021-09-24 
��������	
���
��	����	���� 
Executor or Authorised 
Agent: Derek Charles  
Gibberd  
D GIBBERD ATTORNEYS  
PO Box 36030, Glosderry, 
7702 
dgibb@iafrica.com 
Tel: 021 674 7623   

02SAXG

COBREL PROPERTY (PTY) 
LTD (IN VOLUNTARY 

LIQUIDATION) 

(REG. NO: 1983 / 
008248/07) 

Notice is hereby given in 
terms of Section 356(2) (b) of 
the Companies Act, No. 61 of 
1973, as amended, that a 
Special Resolution for the 
winding up of the above-
named company as a Credi-
tors Voluntary Winding Up 
was duly passed by the 
Directors on 6 March 2023, 
and registered with the 
Companies and Intellectual 
Property Commission on 23 
March 2023. 
Attorney firm name and 
address  
RUBEN LANCE HEALLEY 
INC. 
43 Parker Street,  
Durbanville, 7550 
Tel: 084 701 5241  
Email: info@rlhlaw.co.za 

02SARI

NOTICE TO CREDITORS IN 
DECEASED ESTATES 

All persons having claims 
against the undermentioned 
estate must lodge it with the 
Executor concerned within 
30 days (or as indicated) 
from date of publication 
hereof.  
Province: Gauteng 
Estate No: 28212/2019 
Surname: MISTRY 
First Names: MARY MEGAN 
Date of Birth: 1937-01-03 
ID No: 3701030060081 
Last Address: 29 Kildare
Avenue, Parkview, 2193 
Date of Death: 2019-11-01 
��������	
���
��	 
Johannesburg 
DHARMITABEN  
RAMLUCKUN 
29 Kildare Avenue, Parkview, 
2193 
dramluckun@icloud.com 
dbramlickun@absamail.co.za 
Tel: 082 925 1376 

02SBXT

NOTICE TO CREDITORS IN 
DECEASED ESTATES 

All persons having claims 
against the under-mentioned
estate must lodge it with the 
Executor concerned within 
30 days (as indicated) from 
date of publication hereof. 
Province: Gauteng 
Estate No: 002132/2023 
Surname: STEYN 
First Names:  
JOHANNES HENDRIK 
Date of Birth: 1974-05-28 
ID No: 740528 5050 08 8 
Last Address: G02, The 
Jewels Tower, Dubai, Marina 
Date of Death: 2022-11-24 
��������	
���
��	�������� 
CITADEL FIDUCIARY (PTY) 
LTD 
Kaaimans Building, 
Lynnwood Bridge Office Park 
14 Hilden Road, Lynwood 
Manor, Pretoria 
estates@citadel.co.za 
Tel: 012 470 2500 

02SB3M

IN THE ESTATE OF THE 
LATE 

Surname: LEWIS 
First Names:  
LAURENCE MAX 
Estate No: 8443/2022 
ID No: 571013 5086 08 9 
Date of death: 20/04/2022  
Last Address: 10 Luke 
Street, Potchefstroom  
All persons having claims 
against the above-mentioned
estate are required to lodge 
their claims with the under-
signed within 30 days after 
the date of publication here-
of.  
Name and address of  
Executor or Authorised
Agent:  
Paul Simon Hay  
HAY & SCOTT 
ATTORNEYS  
P O Box 12000, Dorpspruit, 
3206 
taryn@hayandscott.co.za 

Tel: 0333424800
02SB3Q

NOTICE TO CREDITORS IN 
DECEASED ESTATES 

All persons having claims 
against the undermentioned 
estate must lodge it with the 
Executor concerned within 
30 days (or as indicated) 
from date of publication 
hereof.  
Province: Western Cape  
Estate No: 3734/2023 
Surname: VIVEIROS 
First Names:  
JOSE CARLOS  
FERNANDES 
Date of Birth: 1958-12-28 
ID No: 581228 5141 18 3 
Last Address: 5 Groenveld  
Avenue, Bothasig,  
Western Cape, 7441 
Date of Death: 2023-02-18 
��������	
���
��	����	���� 
FIONA STORE  
P O Box 131, Bergvliet, 7864 
fiona.store@fsaa.co.za 
Tel: 082 990 7921 
                                 02SAIN 

PURSUANT TO SECTION 
17 (4) OF THE 

INSOLVENCY ACT, 1936, 
AND SECTION 356 (1) OF 
THE COMPANIES ACT, 

1973,  
Notice is hereby given by the 
Masters of the High Court 
that the company mentioned 
below has been wound up 
provisionally by order of the 
said Court. 
The particulars are given in 
the following order: 
(1) 2019/050851/07  
(2) Falaz Bulk Carriers  
(PTY) LTD  
(3) 14 February 2023 and  
(4) In the High Court of South 
Africa Limpopo Division,
Polokwane under Case No: 
11626/2022 
and  
(5) upon application by  
PRIME TRADE FINANCE
(RF) (PTY) LTD. 
                               02SBRW 

NOTICE TO CREDITORS IN 
DECEASED ESTATES 

All persons having claims 
against the undermentioned 
estate must lodge it with the 
Executor concerned within 
30 days (or as indicated) 
from date of publication 
hereof.  
Province: Gauteng   
Estate No: 006422/2023 
Surname: SMUTS 
First Names: JULIUS 
Date of Birth: 1920-03-11 
ID No: 2003115025084 
Last Address: 64 Outspan 
Road, Johannnesburg, 2197 
Date of Death: 2023-03-05 
��������	
���
��	 
Johannesburg 
BOUWER MALHERBE  
ATTORNEYS  
P O Box 21644, 
Helderkruin, 1733 
glenda@legalworks.co.za 
Tel: 087 057 5789 

02SAYP

NOTICE TO CREDITORS IN 
DECEASED ESTATES  

In the estate of the late:  
Surname: NICOL 
First Names: PAMELA DEE 
Estate No: 1958/2023 
ID No: 3102130064182 
Date of Death: 01-02-2023 
Last Address: Unit 605,  
4 Heuglins Lane,  
Amber Valley, Howick 
All persons having claims
against the abovementioned 
estate are required to lodge 
their claims with the under-
signed within 30 days after 
the date of publication here-
of. 
Paul Simon Hay 
HAY & SCOTT  
ATTORNEYS 
PO Box 12000,  
Dorpspruit, 3206 
taryn@hayandscott.co.za 
Tel: 033 342 4800 

                                 02SB8Z 

NOTICE TO CREDITORS IN 
DECEASED ESTATES 

All persons having claims 
against the undermentioned 
estate must lodge it with the 
Executor concerned within 
30 days (or as indicated) 
from date of publication 
hereof.  
Province: Western Cape  
Estate No: 3869/2023 
Surname: BRUMMER 
First Names:  
SUSANA MAGRITHA 
Date of Birth: 1929-06-25 
ID No: 290625 0046 08 9 
Last Address: 56 3rd Ave-
nue, Sandbaai 7200 
Date of Death: 2023-01-15 
��������	
���
��	����	���� 
BRITS DREYER INC  
9 Louwville Street,  
Bellville, 7530  
gbrits@britsdreyer.co.za 
Tel: 021 946 1127 

02SAE6

PURSUANT TO SECTION 
17 (4) OF THE 

INSOLVENCY ACT, 1936, 
AND SECTION 356 (1) OF 
THE COMPANIES ACT, 

1973  
Notice is hereby given by the 
Masters of the High Court 
that the company mentioned 
below has been wound up 
provisionally by order of the 
said Court. 
The particulars are given in 
the following order: 
(1) 2012/195706/07  
(2) Falaz Protection  
Services (Pty) Ltd  
(3) 14 February 2023 and
(4) In the High Court of South 
Africa Limpopo Division,
Polokwane under case
number 11628/2022 
and (5) upon application by
PRIME TRADE FINANCE  
(RF) (PTY) LTD. 

02SB4V

N O T I C E 
In the Estate of the Late 
BARBARA DAWN ALLSOP  
ID No: 2910210055081  
of Tamarisk, 1 Africander 
Avenue, Kommetjie, 7975 
Western Cape.  
��������	
���	
��	 
002773/2023/ 
Creditors And Debtors in the 
above Estate are hereby 
required to file their claims
with and pay their debts to 
the Undersigned within 30 
days of the publication of this 
notice. 
Dated at Claremont this  
8th Day of March 2023. 
L. VAN ZYL 
P.O. Box 44255 
Claremont 
7735 
                               02SAYN 
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OKUCETYWEYO UKUKHUTSHWA KWAMANGCWABA NOKUFUDUKISWA 

KWAMANGCWABA ANTANDATHU ACHONGIWEYO KUNYE NOKUVA  VANYWA 

KOBUKHO BAMANGCWABA AMANE KWINKONZO YAMANZI UMNGENI WATERS 

NGENXA YOKUCETYWEYO KOKWAKHIWA KWEDAMA ILUDEKE, KUMASIPALA 

WENGINGQI I-WINNIE MADIKIZELA-MANDELA  KUMASIPALA WESITHILI i-ALFRED 

NZO, KWIPHONDO LEMPUMA KOLONI 

 

IGAMA LEPROJEKTHI: Ukugrunjwa kwamangcwaba kunye nokufuduswa kwamangcwaba 

antandathu achongiweyo kunye nokuvavanywa kobukho kwamangcwaba amane osapho 

lakwaHlangabezo eMpuma Koloni. 

UMFAKI-SICELO: IGanwa Consulting and Development egameni loMngeni Water 

INDAWO: Indawo yeprojekthi ikwilali yaseSilangwe, kumasipala wengingqi kaWinnie 

Madikizela-Mandela kumasipala wesithili iAlfred Nzo kwiphondo leMpuma Koloni. 

UMSEBENZI OCETYWAYO: 

Isaziso siyanikezelwa ukuba iSetjo Sesho Consultant (Pty) Ltd yonyulwe yiGanwa Consulting 

and Development egameni loMgeni Water, ukuba ifake isicelo sokukhutshwa kwesidumbu 

engcwabeni elicetywayo kunye nokufuduswa kwamangcwaba aNtandathu achongiweyo kunye 

nokuvavanywa kwamangcwaba amane anokubakho wosapho lakwaHlangabezo, abekwe pha-

kathi kwenkonzo yoMngeni Water kulwakhiwo olucetywayo lwedama iLudeke kwiPhondo 

leMpuma Koloni, eMzantsi Afrika. 

IIMFUNO ZOMTHETHO 

Isicelo senziwa ngokwemiqathango ye: 

 Umthetho iHuman Tissue Act, uNombolo 65 ka-1983 (njengoko ulungisiwe); 
UMthetho Wokususwa Kwamangcwaba Nezidumbu Ezifileyo Ummiselo, uNombolo 7 
ka-1925; 

 UMmiselo wokukhutshwa kwesidumbu engcwabeni, onguNombolo 12 ka-1980; 

 ICandelo lama-35 kunye neCandelo lama-36 loMthetho we-National Heritage Re-
sources Act (NHRA), uNombolo 25 ka-1999; I-South African Heritage Resources 
Agency (SAHRA) ukuze ifumane imvume yokugrumba amathambo abantu 
abachatshazelwe luphuhliso lukhankanywe ngasentla kunye nokungenelela kwakhona 
kwindawo echazwe ngumasipala okanye indawo njengoko kuvunyelwene nezalamane. 

 

UKUBHALISA KUNYE NEZIMVO: 

Ukuqinisekisa ukuba uchongiwe kwaye ubhalisiwe njengomntu onomdla okanye ochap-

hazelekayo kwaye izimvo zakho ziyaqwalaselwa, nceda ufake igama lakho, iinkcukacha 

zoqhagamshelwano, isizathu somdla wakho kunye nemiba/iinkxalabo, ngokubhala okanye 

ngomnxeba, kuSetjo Sesho Consultants (Pty) kwisithuba seentsuku ezingama-60 sesi saziso, 

kwaye kungadlulanga umhla we-21 kuJuni 2023. Nceda uqaphele ukuba kuphela ngaMaqela 

aBanomdla naChaphazelekayo abhalisiweyo (I&APs) aya kwaziswa ngamanye amathuba oku-

bandakanyeka kule nkqubo. Ngawo nawaphi na amanye amagalelo nceda uqhagamshelane ne-

SAHRA ngokuthe ngqo kunye namalungu eqela le Setjo Sesho Consultants. Umntu 

woqhagamshelwano we-SAHRA: Nks. Thingahangwi Tshivhase (TTshivhase@sahra.org.za) 

Nayiphi na imibuzo, izimvo, okanye iinkxalabo malunga nesi sicelo zinokubhekiswa kwaSetjo 

Sesho Consultants (Pty) Ltd apha: 

 

Umntu woqhagamshelwano: Nksk Jennifer Munyai 

ISeli: 076 3821 892 

I-imeyile: jennifer@setjosesho.co.za/info@setjosesho.co.za 

Idilesi yeposi: 11 Greenfields, 79 Grimthorpe Avenue, Lincoln Meade, Pietermaritzburg 

Pondoland Times is a local  

community newspaper with 

youth-centric content. Based in 

the rural areas of Bizana, under 

the Alfred Nzo District          

Municipality. 

Pondoland Times prints and 
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Nandipha Magudumana and Thabo Bester were arrested in Tanzania. 
Images via eNCA  

 

T 
he Minister of Police, General Bheki Cele and Justice Minister, 
Ronald Lamola have updated the nation on the progress on the 
deportation of convicted murderer and rapist Thabo Bester, who 
escaped from custody at the Mangaung Correctional facility. Bester 

was believed to have died in his cell in May last year. 
 
Both Ministers would like to thank the government of Tanzania. This is said 
to come after it's unequivocal co-operation in the matter which relates to the 
arrest and process of deportation of Thabo Bester and accomplice Dr Nandi-
pha Magudumana. 
 

" 
They will endeavor to emulate this level of co-operation with 
other countries in areas of mutual legal assistance and related 
matters". 
 

The deportation of the fugitives have been successfully concluded as a high 
level of delegations, led by the Department of Home Affairs were sent to 
Tanzania on Monday 09 April 2023. 
 
The update confirmed that these fugitives have been returned to South Africa. 
Mr Thabo Bester has been readmitted into the Kgosi Mampuru Central Maxi-
mum Correctional facility and Dr Nandipha Magudumana is under arrest, 
pending her first court appearance. 
 
The Ministry of Police, Ministry of Justice and Correctional Services are 
grateful to all the role players seized with this matter thus far, this includes 
state agencies and members of the public who shared information that has 
assisted in the detention of the two fugitives, following an extensive man 
hunt. Thus far there is considerable progress with a number of arrests being 
effected. 
- Photo/eNCA 

 

UMBHALI WAMABALI WASEMAMPONDWENI 
UNGUMHLOBO KUNYE NOSIBA 

GOVERNMENT UPDATE ON ESCAPEE THABO 

BESTER AND DR. NANDIPHA MAGUDUMANA 

Vuyolwethu Marafane 

U 
mbhali weencwadi zesiXhosa, u Mzoli Mavimbela uphuma kwilali yase 
Ngxongweni , e Port St Johns kwaye ungumbhali ophume izandla, elinye 
lamabali akhe lifundwe kwisikhululo sosasazo, Umhlobo Wenene F.M. 

U Mavimbela oneminyaka engamashumi amathathu anesithathu ngethuba 
ekudliwano-ndlebe ne Nkonjane Community Radio ubalule uthando lokufunda 
nokubhala njengowona nobangela wokuzibona sele engumbhali. Umbhali weencwadi 
zesiXhosa, u Mzoli Mavimbela uphuma kwilali yase Ngxongweni , e Port St Johns 
kwaye ungumbhali ophume izandla, elinye lamabali akhe lifundwe kwisikhululo so-
sasazo, Umhlobo Wenene F.M. U Mavimbela oneminyaka engamashumi amathathu 
anesithathu ngethuba ekudliwano-ndlebe ne Nkonjane Community Radio ubalule 
uthando lokufunda nokubhala njengowona nobangela wokuzibona sele engumbhali. 

Umbhali weencwadi zesiXhosa, u Mzoli Mavimbela uphuma kwilali yase Ngxong-
weni , e Port St Johns kwaye ungumbhali ophume izandla, elinye lamabali akhe li-
fundwe kwisikhululo sosasazo, Umhlobo Wenene F.M. U Mavimbela oneminyaka 
engamashumi amathathu anesithathu ngethuba ekudliwano-ndlebe ne Nkonjane Com-
munity Radio ubalule uthando lokufunda nokubhala njengowona nobangela wokuzi-
bona sele engumbhali. “Ihambo nzima indenze ndabona isidingo sokuba mandimana 
ukuncedisa abo banomdla wokubhala iincwadi zamabali ukuze ulwazi endinalo 
ndingalugcini kum kuba nam ndaluphokozelwa ngabo sele bekule ndlela”. 

 
Ukwathi unomdla wokuba ngenye imini iincwadi zakhe zifundwe ezikolweni. Kwi-
inzame zoku, ukhuphe inguqulelo ehlalutyiweyo yencwadi yakhe ethi- Amazwembez-
wembe ka Gxuluwe.  
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